22CM-002, Grass Seed and Fertilizer

Anne Arundel County Pubic Schools

Landscape Supply

Nutrien Ag Solutions

Newsom Seed

SiteOne Landscape Supply

ltem # Description Quantity |  Unit price Total price Unit price Total price Unit price Total price Unit price Total price

24-0-0 SCU 50Ib. bags

1A 1,100 $22.13 $24,343.00 No Bid No Bid $15.50 $17,050.00 $14.20 $15,620.00
Lateral Spread Tall Fescue 50Ib. bags

2A 400 $86.00 $34,400.00 No Bid No Bid $94.00 $37,600.00 No Bid No Bid
Oregon (blue tag) Fescue Mix 50Ib bags

3A 400 $86.00 $34,400.00 No Bid No Bid $89.95 $35,980.00 No Bid No Bid
Dolomitic Palletized Limestone 50Ib. Bags

4A 400 $5.01 $2,004.00 $4.65 $1,860.00 $5.45 $2,180.00 $5.52 $2,208.00
Solu Cal - Standard Grade 50lb bags

5A 20 $12.00 $240.00 No Bid No Bid $12.50 $250.00 $12.17 $243.40
21-0-0 Ammonium Sulfate 50Ib bags

6A 60 $13.63 $817.80 $12.75 $765.00 $13.55 $813.00 $20.99 $1,259.40
Bermuda Grass: Riviera 25lb. Bags

7A 30 $317.25 $9,517.50 No Bid No Bid $282.00 $8,460.00 No Bid No Bid
Transitional/Annual Panterra 50Ib. Bags

8A 190 $59.00 $11,210.00 No Bid No Bid $61.75 $11,732.50 No Bid No Bid
Transitional/Annual Ryegrass 50 Ib. bags

gA |Breakout 600 withdrawn withdrawn No Bid No Bid $74.50|  $44,700.00 No Bid No Bid
0-0-7 with .20% Merritt 50Ib. bags

10A 400 $19.44 $7,776.00 $14.25 $5,700.00 $16.95 $6,780.00 $17.40 $6,960.00
46-0-0 Urea Fertilizer 50Ib. bags

11A 300 $19.81 $5,943.00 $17.00 $5,100.00 $20.50 $6,150.00 $21.49 $6,447.00
0-0-50 Sulfate of Potash Fertilizer 50Ib. bags

12A 200 $25.85 $5,170.00 $22.00 $4,400.00 $26.50 $5,300.00 $33.92 $6,784.00
0-0-7 with .067 Acelepryn 50lb. bags

13A 400 $30.23 $12,092.00 $26.50 $10,600.00 $29.50 $11,800.00 $30.52 $12,208.00
0-0-7 with .86% Pre M 50Ib. bags

14A 400 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.85 $6,340.00
0-0-7 with .38% Prodiamine 50lb. bags

15A 400 $12.31 $4,924.00 $12.75 $5,100.00 $11.85 $4,740.00 $17.07 $6,828.00
Field Conditioner, Turface MVP 50Ib. Bags

16A 400 $11.94 $4,776.00 No Bid No Bid $12.35 $4,940.00 $10.89 $4,356.00
Field Conditioner, Turface Quick

17A |50Ib. Bags 400 $11.94 $4,776.00 No Bid No Bid $12.35 $4,940.00 $10.52 $4,208.00
Lebanon Proscape 20-0-5;30 Mesa w/1% Iron

18A |90Ib. bags No substitutions 500 $19.41 $9,705.00 No Bid No Bid $19.40|  $9,700.00 $21.45 $10,725.00
Growmark 24-0-12; 25%XCU 50lb. bags

19A [Or AACPS Equivalent 500 $17.31 $8,655.00 *Rejected *Rejected $16.40 $8,200.00 $19.18 $9,590.00
Lebanon ProScape 32-0-6;30% Mesa 50 Ib.

20A |Pags. No substitutions 500 $24.92|  $12,460.00 No Bid No Bid $25.75]  $12,875.00 $28.65 $14,325.00
Apex 10 - Humic Acid/2.5 Gallon Containers

21A 10 *Rejected *Rejected No Bid No Bid $75.00 $750.00 $331.25 $3,312.50
Total award per year $92,710.00 $28,425.00 $76,550.00 $30,524.00
Total award for 3-year period $278,130.00 $85,275.00 $229,650.00 $91,572.00
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